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QMNEMRE B

Thys Wienekus |

From: Romeo Mohaudi <rmohaudi@wrdm.gov.za>
Sent: ‘ ' Friday, June 23, 2017 11:28 AM

To: Maggie Kotai

Cc: Thys Wienekus

Subject: _ RE: FW: VBS Profile and Banking Certificates
Hi,

| have requested him to excuse himself from the meeting to ensure the payment is done before 12h00.
Regards,

From: Maggie Katoi [mailto:maggiekotoi@gmail.com]

Sent; Friday, 23 June 2017 11:30 AM

To; Romeo Mohaudl
Subject: Re: FW: VBS Profile and Banking Certlificates

Noted Sir,

The secretary just informed me that he is in a section 80 committee meeting. T will have to-send him a message
then.

regards

Maggie Kotoi
Cell No: 061 760 6733
E-mail: maggiekotoi@@gmal.com

On Fr, Jun 23, 2017 at 11:18 AM, Romeo Mohaudi <rmohaudi@wrdm.gov.za> wrote:

Morning,

As per our telephone discussion please ensure that Thys receives the attached documents and invest the money
through to VBS Mutual Banlk. The amount agreed ig R50 million,

The investment deposit must be made today before 12h00,



